
CITY OF MESA 
REVISED TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 

MONDAY, MAY 9, 2011 
STREET LIGHT LAMPS, LUMINAIRES & COMPONENTS 

(REQUEST FOR BID #2011145) 
 

These bids are as read at the bid opening. 
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and for correction of mathematical errors 

 

Description/Total Net Bid Border States Electric 
Phoenix, AZ 

Consolidated Electrical Distributors 
DBA AZ Electric Supply 

Mesa, AZ 
Street Light Lamps, 
Luminaires, & Components 
 
    Group A 
    Group B 
    Group C 
    Group D      
    Group E          
    Group F              
    Group G 
    Group H 

 
 
 

$52,115.28 
Non Responsive 
Non Responsive 

$53,909.80 
Non Responsive 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

 
 
 

$50,731.97 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid  

 

Description/Total Net Bid Electric Supply Inc. 
Phoenix, AZ 

Essco Wholesale Electric 
Mesa, AZ 

Street Light Lamps, 
Luminaires, & Components 
 
    Group A 
    Group B      
    Group C    
    Group D     
    Group E          
    Group F              
    Group G 
    Group H 

 
 
 

$56,239.39 
Non Responsive 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

 
 
 

$66,364.49 
Non Responsive 

No Bid 
No Bid 

$7,698.75 
No Bid 

$338.00 
$181.95 

 
 

Description/Total Net Bid 
General Supply & Services, Inc. 

DBA Gexpro 
Gilbert, AZ 

 

Graybar Electric Co. 
Phoenix, AZ 

Street Light Lamps, 
Luminaires, & Components 
 
    Group A 
    Group B      
    Group C    
    Group D    
    Group E          
    Group F              
    Group G 
    Group H 

 
 
 

$51,684.78 
Non Responsive 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

 
 
 

$91,489.56 
Non Responsive 
Non Responsive 
Non Responsive 

$35,616.75 
No Bid 

$350.00 
No Bid 
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CITY OF MESA 
REVISED TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 

MONDAY, MAY 9, 2011 
STREET LIGHT LAMPS, LUMINAIRES & COMPONENTS 

(REQUEST FOR BID #2011145) 
 

These bids are as read at the bid opening. 
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and for correction of mathematical errors 

 

Description/Total Net Bid HD Supply Utilities 
Phoenix, AZ 

Lumintek Lighting, Inc. 
San Dimas, CA 

Street Light Lamps, 
Luminaires, & Components 
 
    Group A 
    Group B      
    Group C    
    Group D    
    Group E          
    Group F              
    Group G 
    Group H 

 
 
 

$38,664.15 
Non Responsive 

$170,488.52 
$50,848.10 

$4,878.25 
No Bid 

$324.00 
$186.98 

 
 
 

$56,740.21 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

 

Description/Total Net Bid North Coast Electric 
Chandler, AZ 

Voss Electric 
DBA Voss Lighting 

Phoenix, AZ 
Street Light Lamps, 
Luminaires, & Components 
 
    Group A 
    Group B      
    Group C    
    Group D      
    Group E          
    Group F              
    Group G 
    Group H 

 
 
 

$48,611.79 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

 
 
 

$41,097.40 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

 
 

Description/Total Net Bid 
Wesco Distribution 

DBA Brown Wholesale Electric 
Phoenix, AZ 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 
Albuquerque, NM 

Street Light Lamps, 
Luminaires, & Components 
 
    Group A      
    Group B 
    Group C   
    Group D      
    Group E          
    Group F              
    Group G 
    Group H 

 
 
 

$42,868.20 
Non Responsive 

No Bid 
No Bid 

$6,375.00 
No Bid 

$338.00 
$178.00 

 
 
 

Non Responsive 
$25,000.00 

$169,726.40 
$50,044.00 

$4,527.50 
No Bid 
No Bid 

$200.00 
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